






Our Path Reference: SHR-0157        

 


 

Parish:  Munslow Grid Reference: SO522885

  


 


Application Details

 


 

Map of Path:

 

 


Claimed route is shown by a red dashed line.


  







Claimed Route From Munslow to Upper Millichope showing part of it as a Bridleway.


  







Route is made up with a number of definitive footpaths.


  





  





  







Route leaves Munslow as an unclassified county road.


  







The unclassified county road is known as Park Lane and is on the List of Streets.


  





There is a length of route with no status lying  between the end of Park Lane and the beginning of the 
bridleway. This should become a definitive bridleway.


  





Description of Path: 

Path starts at Munslow Village SO52188924 and ends at Upper Millichope SO52328793 


Way leaves Munslow as a metalled road known as Park Lane. This leads to an unmetalled road enjoying 
the same width with a field gate. This lane follows the boundary wall of Millichope Park which is on the right 
with mature trees on the left. Passing through another gate the claimed route enters a grass field. The 
definitive line of the bridleway is shown following a depression against the park wall, however a well defined 
track bearing right provides easier going. This track rises upwards and passes through another gate giving 
access to Millichope Parkland. There is no well defined way here but going straight across the parkland 
with views of Millichope Hall on the right a stile provides walkers with access to woodland. Continuing in the 
same direction a stoned track is reached. Following this track one bears left on a right bend. The route 
descends down Mousetree Bank and enters an open field at the bottom via a gateway.Ahead is Upper 
Millichope. Footpath 0546/42/2 is obstructed.

 


  




Current Recorded Status: 

 

Path is recorded on the Definitive Map

 

Part of the path is recorded as Footpath on the Definitive Map.

 

Path is not recorded on the List of Streets.

 

Part of the path is recorded on the List of Streets.

 


 

Status being applied for: Bridleway

  

Notes:

 

Part of the path is believed to be obstructed.

 

 

 

 

 ----------------------------------------------------------------------- 

 

 

Our Path Reference: SHR-0157        Grid Reference: SO522885 Path starts at Munslow Village 
SO52188924 and ends at Upper Millichope SO52328793

 


  


Documentary Evidence

 


  

Evidence from Maps:

 


  

OS One Inch Ordnance Survey Maps - One-inch England and Wales

 

Shown as a road to Millichope Park then continues as a double dotted route.

  

Ordnance Survey Maps - 25 inch England and Wales

 

Leaves Munslow as an enclosed track, then proceeds to Upper Millichope as a double hatched way. BR is 
shown along route in three different places in the 1903 edition.

  

OS Six Inch Ordnance Survey Maps - Six-inch England and Wales

 

Shows route through from Munslow to Upper Millichope. Way is annotated with BR in Millichope Parkland.

  

Ordnance Survey, 1:25,000 maps of Great Britain

 

Shows route throughout. Annotated with BR in Millichope Parkland.

  

Bartholomew's Half Inch to the Mile Maps of England and Wales

 

Shown as an inferior road unsuitable for cyclists from Munslow to Upper Millichope.

  




Primary Evidence:

  

Inland Revenue Valuation Records - Finance (1908-10) Act 1910

  

The Finance Act Map shows the path from Munslow to the beginning of Millichope Park clearly excluded 
from adjoining hereditaments which is good evidence that the path was considered a public road.


Tithe Records


The Tithe Map and Apportionment show the position of John Hall’s house and the location of Lowell’s 
Meadow. These were described in the Endows Journal to indicate the position of the footpaths proposed to 
be altered. The Tithe Map of Upper Millichope depicts the way past Massey Farm in a similar manner to 
other roads in the vicinity.

  


Other Evidence:

  

Definitive Map Records

 

Parish claim of 1950 describes claimed route as BR6 and FP7. Eaton under Haywood Parish claim of 1950 
describes claimed route as FP 42. It is described as leaving Upper Millichope via a short open lane to the 
right of Massey Farm. It travels through a field gate and two wicket gates to reach Millichope Park. It follows 
the same line as the claimed route entering a lane to reach Munslow. Recorded as regularly used  in the 
past and today ie in 1950.

  

Quarter Session Records

 

In June 1842 it was proposed to alter a number of footpaths in the Munslow area. These changes were 
advertised in the Eddows Journal and were to go before the Justices at the Quarter Sessions held in 
Shrewsbury. The first described a footpath leading from Thonglands and ending opposite a cottage 
occupied by John Hall in Munslow Village.. The last footpath described in the newspaper notice ran from a 
field called Lowdales and entered a Public Bridle and Footway from Munslow to Upper Millichope. Both the 
cottage and field have been identified on the Tithe Map of 1843. Due to a successful appeal by Richard 
Powell Rector of Munslow these proceedings were never heard at the Quarter Sessions and the plan  
outlining these proposals was not kept. The Rector  also referred to the Public Bridle Road from Munslow to 
Upper Millichope.

  

Further Evidence

 

Photographs of claimed route through Millichope Park to Upper Millichope.

  

Summary and Statement of Reasons:

 

Quote from Andrews -v- Secretary of State 2015 paragraph 44


“ In an era before the car and when carriages and carts were expensive, public rights of way on foot and 
horseback were as important for the public in getting around in the local area as were the public 
carriageways for vehicular traffic”…………..” Public rights of way (on foot and on horseback) were of major 
importance for the public who used them”


This route is shown on maps from 1813 onwards. It is described as a public bridle and footway in Eddows 
Journal in 1842. This description was not challenged but the proposed  footpath diversions were strongly 
opposed by the Munslow vicar who intervened to prevent any alteration to their existing line. The proposed 
footpath to be diverted ran 


“ into a certain Public Bridle and Footway from the Village of Munslow aforesaid to Upper Millichope.”


The claimed  bridle road gave the shortest line of travel between the  two communities of 
Munslow and Upper Millichope and would have been regarded of considerable importance.




The parish claims of the early 1950’s record a footpath and bridle road, regularly used in the past and 
within living memory. No stiles were recorded. Instead there were wicket and field gates. 


The 25 inch Ordnance Survey maps record a BR in three separate places, one on the enclosed track near 
Park Lane, one in Millichope Park and a third at the end of Millichope Park before Mousetree Bank.


OS One Inch Ordnance Survey Maps - One-inch England and Wales

 

Ordnance Survey. One-inch to the mile, Revised New Series, Sheet 166, 1899


Shown as a road with two solid lines to Millichope Park. Remainder of route double dotted to Upper 
Millichope.


  







OS Old Series First Edition, 1813

Route clearly shown from Munslow to Upper Millichope.


  







Ordnance Survey Maps - 25 inch England and Wales

Ordnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1884

Shown as an enclosed track along park boundary wall.


  





Ordnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1884


Enclosed track to Old Quarry then as a double hatched way through Millichope Parkland.


  







Ordnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1884


Route continues as a double hatched way.


  





Ordnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.4, 1884


Continues  as double hatched way with a parcel No 988 in the last section before meeting road.


  







OS County Series, 1883-1884

Parcel No 988 clearly shown.  







Ordnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1903

Shows BR on claimed route in Millichope Park.  





Ordnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1903

Shows BR on enclosed track near Park Lane.


  





Ordnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1903

Enlarged view of enclosed track near ParkLane.


  







Ordnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.4, 1903

Shows BR on route approaching Mousetree Bank.


 


OS Six Inch Ordnance Survey Maps - Six-inch England and Wales


 

Ordnance Survey six inch, LX1V.NE, 1903


Shows BR in Millichope Parkland.


  





Ordnance Survey six inch, LX1V.NE, 1953


Shows BR in Millichope Parkland.


  







Ordnance Survey six inch, LX1V.NE, 1903


BR in Millichope Parkland.


  





Ordnance Survey, 1:25,000 maps of Great Britain


 

Ordnance Survey 1:25000, 1950


Annotated with BR in Millichope Parkland. Shows route from Munslow to Upper Millichope.


  







Ordnance Survey 1:25000, 32/58A, 1950


BR in Parkland.


  







Bartholomew’s Half Inch to the Mile Maps of England and Wales

Bartholomew Half Inch, Sheet 17, 1903

Shown as an inferior road from Munslow to Upper Millichope.


  





Inland Revenue Valuation Records - Finance (1908-10) Act 1910 

IR132/4/770, Shropshire LX1V.8, 1910

Road to Millichope Park from Munslow is excluded from valuation.


  







IR132/4/770, Shropshire LX1V.8, 1910


Enlarged View.


  







Tithe Records


 

Tithe Map


Shows claimed route leaving Munslow, crossing Millichope Park to Parish Boundary.


  








Tithe Map of Upper Millichope showing road past Massey Farm lying between numbers 756 and 755 and 
754.




Copy of Tithe with Field Names, 1843

Shows position of Lowdells Meadow and Lowdells, fields described in Eddows Journal proposing to close

the footpath crossing them which ran into the Public Bridle Road and Footpath running between Munslow 
and Upper Millichope.


  







Tithe Map with Field Names, 1843


  





Tithe Map,, IR29/29/229, 1843


Close up of Munslow showing the position of John Hall's House.


  







Tithe Transcript, 1843


  





Tithe Apportionment, IR29/29/229, 1843


  







Definitive Map Records

Munslow Parish Claim, 1950

Claimed route is 6BR and FP7.

  





Munslow Parish Claim, 1950


Describes Bridleway as 6BR and Footpath 7 which ends at Parish Boundary but is used to Upper 
Millichope.


  






No 6 Bridle Road Starts at gate at end of lane through two field gates on to farm buildings then turns into 
Number 7 Footpath. Starting at farm buildings finishing at parish boundary. The bridle road is old and used, 
the footpath is good and used to Upper Millichope.


Eaton under Haywood Parish Claim Map, 1950

Claimed route is Footpath No 42.


  





Eaton under Haywood Parish Claim, 1950


  







Eaton under Haywood Parish Claim enlarged, 1950


  




Footpath 42. Up short green lane (at Upper Millichope) to right of Massey Farm. Field gate into field.Up 
field by wicket into wood. Wicket at top of wood on parish boundary. Footpath continues in Munslow parish 
across Millichope ParK to join lane from Munslow. Regularly used throughout living memory. Regularly 
used today.




, 1:2500, 1883


Shows open lane at Upper Millichope to right of Massey Farm. (Numbered 988.)


  







Quarter Session Records

Eddows Journal, 1842

Newspaper Article describing proposed footpath alterations in Munslow.  




Eddows Journal, 1842

Continuation of Article.


  







Eddows Journal, 1842


Article describing line of Footpath entering Public Bridle Road which ran from Munslow to Upper Millichope.


  





Copy from Tithe Map shows John Hall’s house, land owned by Robert Norgrave Pemberton and occupied 
by Edward Edwards.




“And also for stopping up as unnecessary and useless a certain other public Footway, situate in the said 
Township of Munslow, leading out of the said first mentioned Footway commencing at a certain Pit of Water 
near to the south-western Corner of a certain Piece of Land called the Lowdales, the Property of the said 
Robert Norgrave Pemberton, and in the Occupation of the said Edward Edwards, and proceeding in a 
northern Direction along the same Piece of Land to the north-western Corner thereof, towards and into a 
certain Public Bridle and Footway from the Village of Munslow aforesaid to Upper Millichope, and ending 
thereat, of the Length of three Hundred and sixty-five Yards and one Foot. ”




Quarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842

Vicar of Munslow presented a detailed objection to proposed Footpath Alterations.Page 1 Top


  





Quarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842


Vicar's Objection Page 1 Centre Page.


  







Quarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842

Vicar's Objection End of Page 1  





Quarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842

Vicar's Objection Top Page 2


  







Quarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842


Vicar's Objection Page 2 Centre.


  





Quarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842


Vicar's Objection End of Page 2.


  







Quarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842

Vicar's Objection Top Page 3

  







Quarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842


Vicar's Objection End of Page 3


  




Transcript of Vicar's Objection.


  







Transcript of Vicar's Objection Page 2


  







Transcript of Vicar's Objection Page 3.


  




The vicar’s appeal was successful, the footpaths were retained in their original position and they still exist 
today as definitive footpaths.


  




Other Evidence

 


Indicates position of selected photographs.


  





Photograph at A. End of enclosed track following park wall.

  







Photograph at B  Shows old track against park wall.

  





C Gate into parkland.


  







E Stile into woodland.


  







F Track through woodland.


  







G Beginning descent of Mousetree Bank.


  







G Mousetree Bank

  







H Looking towards Upper Millichope.


  





 


  







I. Track followed to road.


Definitive footpath is obstructed by fence. Line of footpath is on the  other side of the fence passing Massey 
Farmhouse to the road in Upper Millichope.


  







  


APPENDIX II Evidence Documents


   

List of Evidence Documents	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 

 


Ordnance Survey. One-inch to the mile, Revised New Series, Sheet 166, 1899, National Library of 
ScotlandOS Old Series First Edition, 1813, National Library of AustraliaOrdnance Survey 25 inch, 
LX1V.8, 1884, National Library of ScotlandOrdnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1884, National Library of 
ScotlandOrdnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1884, National Library of ScotlandOrdnance Survey 25 inch, 
LX1V.4, 1884, National Library of ScotlandOS County Series, 1883-1884, Old Maps.co.ukOrdnance 
Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1903, National Library of ScotlandOrdnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1903, 
National Library of ScotlandOrdnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.8, 1903, National Library of 
ScotlandOrdnance Survey 25 inch, LX1V.4, 1903, National Library of ScotlandOrdnance Survey six 
inch, LX1V.NE, 1903, National Library of ScotlandOrdnance Survey six inch, LX1V.NE, 1953, National 
Library of ScotlandOrdnance Survey six inch, LX1V.NE, 1903, National Library of ScotlandOrdnance 
Survey 1:25000, 1950, National Library of ScotlandOrdnance Survey 1:25000, 32/58A, 1950, National 
Library of ScotlandBartholomew Half Inch, Sheet 17, 1903, National Library of ScotlandIR132/4/770, 
Shropshire LX1V.8, 1910, Kew National archivesIR132/4/770, Shropshire LX1V.8, 1910, Kew National 
ArchivesTithe Map, GeneologistCopy of Tithe with Field Names, 1843, Shrewsbury ArchivesTithe Map 
with Field Names, 1843, Shrewsbury ArchivesTithe Map,, IR29/29/229, 1843, GeneologistTithe 
Transcript, 1843, GeneologistTithe Apportionment, IR29/29/229, 1843, GeneologistMunslow Parish 
Claim, 1950, Shropshire Council Rights of WayMunslow Parish Claim, 1950, Shropshire Council Rights 
of WayEaton under Haywood Parish Claim Map, 1950, Shropshire Council Rights of WayEaton under 
Haywood Parish Claim, 1950, Shropshire Council Rights of WayEaton under Haywood Parish Claim 
enlarged, 1950, Shropshire Council Rights of Way, 1:2500, 1883, Old Maps.co.ukEddows Journal, 1842, 
Shrewsbury ArchivesEddows Journal, 1842, Shrewsbury ArchivesEddows Journal, 1842, Shrewsbury 
ArchivesQuarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842, Shrewsbury ArchivesQuarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842, 
Shrewsbury ArchivesQuarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842, Shrewsbury ArchivesQuarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 
1842, Shrewsbury ArchivesQuarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842, Shrewsbury ArchivesQuarter Sessions, 
QS/6/31, 1842, Shrewsbury ArchivesQuarter Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842, Shrewsbury ArchivesQuarter 
Sessions, QS/6/31, 1842, Shrewsbury ArchivesEddowes Journal, 1842, Shrewsbury Archives, 
Shropshire Great Outdoors Interactive Map
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